IFB PC'140319 Pinal County
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland Fmgfﬁ E;?palrtsntﬂent
. Pinal St.
PINAL+*COUNTY Cement o Bldg. A
wide open opportunity Response Form 2 — Prlcmg P.O. Box 1348
Sheet Florence, AZ 85132

Responder Name: RAY DRIGGS // CEMEX

Responders shall complete the following Response Form, indicating their responses in the spaces provided. Additional pages may
be added so long as they are clearly referenced in the spaces provided.

Acceptability of Responses

Offers that do not include this completed Response Form or that do include an incomplete Response Form or that include a
completed Response Form with unacceptable responses may cause the entire offer to be deemed unacceptable and therefore non-
responsive.

1 Price

Responders shall complete the following pricing information below on the products your company offers which could be
utilized by various departments throughout Pinal County to provide Aggregate, Slurry, and Portland Cement as needed.

Provide PLANT address for this area:
AGGREGATES = COOLIDGE PLANT #4114 @ 14152 N ATTAWAY RD, COOLIDGE, AZ

REDI MIX = COLLIDGE PLANT # 4103 @ 14152 N ATTAWAY RD, COOLIDGE, AZ
ASPHALT = GOMEZ ASPHALT BATCH PLANT # 1396 @ 5150 27™ AVE, PHOENIX, AZ
Delivery Area Item Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
A Quantity Plant Jobsite
Apache junction, 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 16.30
. M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1
Florence Junction, 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 N/A N/A
P.A.G. 303-2
Kings Ranch, 3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 16.30
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
Queen Valley 4. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material P.A.G. 304
5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material A.D.O.T. 304
6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 N/A N/A
Base Material M.A.G. 705
7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $7.50 $16.30
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $7.50 $16.30
702-1, Type B
9. 2" Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $7.50 $16.30
10. | Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 N/A N/A
| M6
1. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 N/A N/A
Table 716-2
12, Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
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PINAL+COUNTY
wide open opportunity

Cement

IFB PC-140319
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County

Finance Department

31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
Sub-Section C 3/8”" Chips
AREA A 13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A

716-2*

14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A

. 716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
- - Sub-Section C 3/8”" Chips

16. 3/8” Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 N/A N/A
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type |l

17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05

18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $14.50 23.30

19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Section B

20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $14.00 $22.80
Sub-Section B

21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A& D

22, Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & D

23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & E

24, Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & E

25. One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 N/A $70.00
Table 728-1

26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
725, Table 725-1, Class AA .

27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $90.00
725, Table 725-1, Class A

28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $86.00
725, Table 725-1, Class B

29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $84.00
725, 725-1, Class C

30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1006, Class S

31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1006, Class B

32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A 100.00
1006, Class P

33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
1006, Class S
NOTE: THIS 1S ADOT CLASS S 3000

34, Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $83.00
1006, Class B

35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A N/A

36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A N/A

37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A $120.00
NOTE: THIS IS 4000 PSI
SHOTCRETE
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PINAL+COUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319

Cement

Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132

38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A $110.00
NOTE: THIS IS 3000 PSI
SHOTCRETE

39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

AREA A 40. Cold Mix, 1/2" Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $110.00 125.00

Phoenix Group 3 Specs

41. Cold Mix, 3/4” Cold Patch per City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications

42. Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 N/A N/A
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications

43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $75.00 87.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

44, Asphalt Concrete 1/2" per M.A.G. TON 100 $65.00 77.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

45, Asphalt Concrete 3/4” per M.A.G. TON 100 $64.00 76.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

46. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2

47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2

48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2

49, Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 N/A N/A

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711
** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.

Solicitation No: PC-140319
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PINAL+COUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319

Cement

Sheet

Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348
Florence, AZ 85132

Provide PLANT address for this area:

NO BID FROM PHOENIX AREA // CEMEX TUCSON AREA HAS BID THIS.

Delivery item Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
Area Quantity Plant Jobsite !
B !
Superior, 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $ '
M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1 \
Sutton Summit 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
P.A.G. 303-2
3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
4, Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material P.A.G. 304
5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material A.D.O.T. 304
6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 $ $
. Base Material M.A.G. 705
7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $ $
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $ $
702-1, Type B
9. 2" Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $ 3
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 $ $
716-1
11. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 $ $
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-2*
14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
16. 3/8” Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 $ $
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type | .
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $ $
19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A& D
22. Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A& D
23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 4 of 26
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IFB PC-1 4031 9 Pinal County
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland Finance Department
Cement 31 N. Pinal St.
PINAL.COUNTY L. Bldg. A
wide open opportunity Response Form 2 — Pricing P.O. Box 1348
Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
Sub-Sections A & E
NO BID FROM 24. Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
PHOENIX AREA Sub-Sections A & E
CEMEX TUCSON
AREA IS
BIDDING THIS.
25, One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 $ $
Table 728-1
26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class AA
27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class A
28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class B
29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, 725-1, Class C
30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class S
31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class B
32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class P
33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class S
34, Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class B
35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
40. Cold Mix, 1/2” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
41. Cold Mix, 3/4” Cold Patch per City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications
42, Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 $ $
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications
43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
44, Asphalt Concrete 1/2" per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
45, Asphalt Concrete 3/4" per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
49, Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 $ $
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PINAL+COUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319
Cement

Sheet

Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348
Florence, AZ 85132

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711
** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.

Provide PLANT address for this area:
AGGREGATES = COOLIDGE PLANT #4114 @ 14152 N ATTAWAY RD, COOLIDGE, AZ

REDI MIX = COLLIDGE PLANT # 4103 @ 14152 N ATTAWAY RD, COOLIDGE, AZ
ASPHALT = GOMEZ ASPHALT BATCH PLANT # 1396 @ 5150 27™ AVE, PHOENIX, AZ
Delivery Area Item Material Unit Estimate Unit Price Unit Price
C d Plant Jobsite
Quantity
Arizona Farms 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 $13.00
M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1
Chandler Heights 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 N/A N/A
P.A.G. 303-2
Queen Creek 3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 - $13.00
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
San Tan 4. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material P.A.G. 304
5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material A.D.O.T. 304
6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 N/A N/A
Base Material M.A.G. 705
7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $7.50 $13.00
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $7.50 $13.00
702-1, Type B
9. 2" Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $7.50 $13.00
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-1
1. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 N/A N/A
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-2*
14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
16. 3/8" Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 N/A N/A
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type I
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $14.50 $20.00
19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 N/A N/A
Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 6 of 26
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IFB PC-140319 Pinal County
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland Fmg?cl\? g?np:}ftsntﬁent
. Pi .
PINAL+COUNTY Cement o Bldg. A
wide open opportunity Response Form 2 — Pricing P.O. Box 1348
Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
Sub-Section B
AREA C 20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $14.50 $20.00

Sub-Section B

21, Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & D

22, Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & D

23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & E

24, Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & E

25. One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 N/A $70.00
Table 728-1

26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
725, Table 725-1, Class AA

27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $90.00
725, Table 725-1, Class A

28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $86.00
725, Table 725-1, Class B

29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $84.00
725, 725-1, Class C

30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1006, Class S

31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1006, Class B

32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
10086, Class P

33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
10086, Class S
NOTE: THIS IS AN ADOT CLASS S
3000

34, Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $83.00
1006, Class B

35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A N/A

36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A N/A

37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A $120.00
NOTE: THIS IS A 4000 PS!
SHOTCRETE

38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A $110.00
NOTE: THIS IS A 3000 PSi
SHOTCRETE

39. Cold Mix, 3/8" Cold Patch, City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

40. Cold Mix, 1/2” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $110.00 $125.00
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

41, Cold Mix, 3/4" Cold Patch per City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications

42. Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 N/A N/A
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications

43, Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $75.00 $89.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 7 of 26
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Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
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Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
44. Asphalt Concrete 1/2” per M.A.G. TON 100 $65.00 $79.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
45, Asphalt Concrete 3/4" per M.A.G. TON 100 $64.00 $78.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
AREAC 47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
49. Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 N/A N/A

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711
** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.

Solicitation No: PC-140319

http://pinalcountyaz.gov/Departments/Finance/Pages/BidsProposals.aspx

Available online at

Page 8 of 26




PINAL+COUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland
Cement

Response Form 2 — Pricing
Sheet

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.

Bldg. A

P.O. Box 1348
Florence, AZ 85132

Provide PLANT address for this area:
AGGREGATES = COOLIDGE PLANT #4114 @ 14152 N ATTAWAY RD, COOLIDGE, AZ

REDI MIX = COOLIDGE PLANT #4103 @ 14152 N ATTAWAY RDT, COOLIDGE, AZ
ASPHALT = GOMEZ ASPHALT BATCH PLANT # 1396 @ 5150 27 " AVE, PHOENIX, AZ
Delivery Area ltem Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
D Quantity Plant Jobsite
Cactus Forest 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1 .
Coolidge 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 N/A N/A
P.A.G. 303-2
Florence 3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
Lake-N-Desert 4. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material P.A.G. 304
La Palma 5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material A.D.O.T. 304
Randolph 6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 N/A N/A
Base Material M.A.G. 705
7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
702-1, Type B
9. 2" Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-1
11. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 N/A N/A
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-2*
14, Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
16. 3/8” Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 N/A N/A
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type |l
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $14.50 19.00
19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Section B
20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $14.50 $20.00
Sub-Section B
21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & D
22. Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 9 of 26
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P.O. Box 1348

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
Sub-Sections A& D
AREAD 23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A

Sub-Sections A & E

24, Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & E

25. One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 N/A $70.00
Table 728-1

26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
725, Table 725-1, Class AA

27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $90.00
725, Table 725-1, Class A

28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $86.00
725, Table 725-1, Class B

29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $84.00
725, 725-1, Class C

30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1006, Class S

31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1006, Class B

32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
1006, Class P

33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
1006, Class S
NOTE: THIS IS AN ADOT CLAS S
3000

34. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $83.00
1006, Class B

35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A N/A

36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A N/A

37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A $120.00
NOTE: THIS IS A 4000 PSI
SHOTCRETE

38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A $110.00
NOTE: THIS IS A 3000 PSI
SHOTCRETE

39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

40. Cold Mix, 1/2" Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $110.00 $126.50
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

41. Cold Mix, 3/4” Cold Patch per City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications

42, Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 N/A N/A
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications

43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $75.00 $91.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

44, Asphalt Concrete 1/2" per M.A.G. TON 100 $65.00 $81.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

45, Asphalt Concrete 3/4" per M.A.G. TON 100 $64.00 $80.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

46. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2

Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 10 of 26
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IFB PC-140319
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

PINAL+COUNTY Cement

wide open opportunity

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
49, Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 N/A N/A

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711
** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.
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wide open opportunity

PINAL+COUNTY

IFB PC-140319 Pinal County
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland Finance Department

Cement 31 I\IIB.IdF;nil St

Response Form 2 — Pricing P.O. Box 1348
Sheet Florence, AZ 85132

Provide PLANT address for this area:

AGGREGATES = CASA GRANDE PLANT # 1464 @ 2305 S ROOF TILE RD, CASA GRANDE, AZ
REDI MIX = SAN TAN PLANT #4112 @ 2126 N TANNER RD, SACATON, AZ
ASPHALT = GOMEZ ASPHALT BATCH PLANT # 1396 @ 5150 27™ AVE, PHOENIX, AZ
Delivery Area ltem Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
E Quantity Plant Jobsite
Arizona City 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1
Casa Grande 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 N/A N/A
P.A.G. 303-2
Eloy 3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
Hopi Hills 4, Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material P.A.G. 304
Picacho 5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material A.D.O.T. 304
S. Hidden Valley 6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 N/A N/A
Base Material M.A.G. 705
Stanfield 7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
702-1, Type B
9. 2" Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $7.50 $12.00
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-1
11. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 N/A N/A
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-2*
14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
Sub-Section C 3/8" Chips
16. 3/8” Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 N/A N/A
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type li
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $14.50 19.00
19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Section B
20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $14.50 $20.00
Sub-Section B
21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & D
22. Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 N/A N/A

Solicitation No: PC-140319

Available online at
http://pinalcountyaz.gov/Departments/Finance/Pages/BidsProposals.aspx
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PINAL*COUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319

Cement

Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132

Sub-Sections A & D

23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A& E

AREA E 24, Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A

Sub-Sections A & E

25. One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 N/A $70.00
Table 728-1

26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
725, Table 725-1, Class AA

27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $90.00
725, Table 725-1, Class A

28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $86.00
725, Table 725-1, Class B

29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $84.00
725, 725-1, Class C

30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1008, Class S

31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1008, Class B

32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
1006, Class P

33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
10086, Class S
NOTE: THIS IS AN ADOT CLASS S
3000

34. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $83.00
10086, Class B

35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A N/A

36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A N/A

37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A $120.00
NOTE: THIS IS A 4000 PS!
SHOTCRETE

38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A $110.00
NOTE: THIS IS A 3000 PSI
SHOTCRETE

39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

40. Cold Mix, 1/2” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $110.00 $124.50
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

41. Cold Mix, 3/4”" Cold Patch per City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications

42, Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 N/A N/A
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications ,

43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $75.00 $89.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

44. Asphalt Concrete 1/2” per M.A.G. TON 100 $65.00 $79.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

45, Asphalt Concrete 3/4” per M.A.G. TON 100 $64.00 $78.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

46. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2

Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 13 of 26
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IFB PC-140319 Pinal County
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland F'”;”Cﬁ E;?P&}r}snt“enf
. Pinal St.
PINAL*COUNTY Cement o Bldg. A
wide open opportunity Response Form 2 — Pricing P.O. Box 1348
Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A..G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
49. Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 N/A N/A

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711
** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.

Provide PLANT address for this area:
NO BID FROM THE PHOENIX AREA // CEMEX TUCSON AREA IS BIDDING THIS.

Delivery Area Item Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
F Quantity Plant Jobsite
Friendly Corners 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1
Picacho Peak 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
P.A.G. 303-2
Pinal Air Park 3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 3 $
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
Red Rock 4, Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material P.A.G. 304
Silverbell 5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material A.D.O.T. 304
6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 $ $
Base Material M.A.G. 705
7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $ $
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $ $
702-1, Type B
9. 2" Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $ $
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 $ $
716-1
11. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 $ $
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-2*
14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8" Chips
16. 3/8” Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 $ $
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type |l
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 14 of 26
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PINAL.COUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319

Cement

Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $ $
19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A & D
AREA F 22. Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A& D
NO BID FROM
THE PHONEIX
AREA // THE
TUCSON AREA
IS BIDDING THIS.
23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
: Sub-Sections A & E
24. Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
Sub-Sections A& E
25. One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 $ $
Table 728-1
26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class AA
27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class A
28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class B
29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, 725-1, Class C
30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class S
31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class B
32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class P
33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class S
34. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ ‘$
1006, Class B
35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
40. Cold Mix, 1/2” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
41. Cold Mix, 3/4” Cold Patch per City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications
42. Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 $ $
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications
43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 15 of 26
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IFB PC-140319 Pinal County
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland F'ng;‘cﬁ E;?Palﬁsn;ent
. Pinal St.
PINAL+COUNTY Cement . Bldg. A
wide open opportunity Response Form 2 — Pricing P.O. Box 1348
Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
44, Asphalt Concrete 1/2” per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
45, Asphalt Concrete 3/4” per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
46. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
49. Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 $ $

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711
** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.

Provide PLANT address for this area:
NO BID FROM THE PHOENIX AREA // THE CEMEX TUCSON AREA IS BIDDING THIS.

Delivery Area Item Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
G Quantity Plant Jobsite
Owl Head Buttes 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1
Panther Buttes 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
P.A.G. 303-2
Saddlebrook 3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
Willow Springs 4, Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material P.A.G. 304
5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material A.D.O.T. 304
6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 $ $
Base Material M.A.G. 705
7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $ $
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $ $
702-1, Type B
9. 2" Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $ $
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 $ $
716-1
11. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 $ $
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 3 $
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-2*
14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-1*
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PINALCOUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319

Cement

Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8”" Chips
16. 3/8" Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 $ 3
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type Il
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $ $
AREA G 19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
NO BID FROM
THE PHONEIX
AREA // THE
TUCSON AREA
IS BIDDING THIS.
20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A& D
22. Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A& D
23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
Sub-Sections A& E
24. Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
Sub-Sections A& E
25. One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 $ $
Table 728-1
26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class AA
27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 3 $
725, Table 725-1, Class A
28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class B
29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, 725-1, Class C
30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class S
31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class B
32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class P
33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class S
34. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class B
35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
40. Cold Mix, 1/2” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Solicitation No: PC-140319 Available online at Page 17 of 26
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IFB PC-140319 Pinal County
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland Finance Department
Cement 31 N. Pinal St.
PINAL+COUNTY . Bldg. A
wide open opportunity Response Form 2 — Pricing P.O. Box 1348
Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
41. Cold Mix, 3/4” Cold Patch per City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications
42, Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 $ $
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications
AREA G 43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
NO BID FROM THE
PHOENIX AREA //
THE CEMEX
TUCSON AREA IS
BIDDING THIS
44. Asphalt Concrete 1/2" per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
45. Asphalt Concrete 3/4” per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
46. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $ '
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2 |
47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $ f
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
49, Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 $ $

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711

** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.
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PINAL+COUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319
Aggregate, Slurry & Portland
Cement

Response Form 2 — Pricing
Sheet

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bidg. A
P.O. Box 1348
Florence, AZ 85132

Provide PLANT address for this area:
NO BID FROM THE PHOENIX AREA // THE CEMEX TUCSON AREA IS BIDDING THIS.

Delivery Area ltem Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
H Quantity Plant Jobsite
Aravaipa 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ '$
M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1
Aravaipa, Beyond 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
Pavement P.A.G. 303-2
Dudleyville 3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
Mammoth 4, Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material P.A.G. 304
Oracle 5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material A.D.O.T. 304
San Manuel 6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 $ $
Base Material M.A.G. 705
Winkelman 7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $ $
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $ $
702-1, Type B
9. 2” Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $ $
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 $ $
716-1
11. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 $ $
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8”" Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-2*
14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
16. 3/8” Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 $ $
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type |l
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $ $
19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A & D
22, Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A & D
23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
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PINAL+COUNTY
wide open opportunity

IFB PC-140319

Cement

Aggregate, Slurry & Portland

Response Form 2 — Pricing

Pinal County
Finance Department
31 N. Pinal St.
Bldg. A
P.O. Box 1348

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132
Sub-Sections A & E
AREA H 24, Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
Sub-Sections A & E
NO BID FROM
THE PHOENIX
AREA /I THE
CEMEX TUCSON
AREA IS
BIDDING THIS.
25, One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 $ $
Table 728-1
26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class AA
27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class A
28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class B
29, Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, 725-1, Class C
30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
10086, Class S
31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class B
32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
10086, Class P
33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 3 $
10086, Class S
34. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class B
35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ 3
36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
40. Cold Mix, 1/2” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
41, Cold Mix, 3/4” Cold Patch per City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications
42. Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 $ $
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications
43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
44, Asphalt Concrete 1/2" per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
45, Asphalt Concrete 3/4" per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
486. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 3 $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
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48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
49, Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 $ $

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711
** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.

Provide PLANT address for this area:
NO BID FROM THE PHOENIX AREA // THE CEMEX TUCSON AREA IS BIDDING THIS.

Delivery Area ltem Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
I Quantity Plant | Jobsite
Kelvin 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $

M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1
Kearny 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
P.A.G. 303-2
Riverside 3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $ $
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
Silver Creek 4. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material P.A.G. 304
Kelvin 5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 $ $
Material A.D.O.T. 304
6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 $ $
Base Material M.A.G. 705
7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $ $
1, Type A
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $ $
702-1, Type B
9. 2" Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $ $
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 $ $
716-1
11. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 $ $
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-2*
14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 $ $
716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 $ $
Sub-Section C 3/8" Chips
16. 3/8” Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 $ $
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type ||
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 $ $
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 3 $
19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
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20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Section B
AREA | 21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A& D
NO BID FROM
THE PHOENIX
AREA // THE
CEMEX TUCSON
AREA IS
BIDDING THIS.
22, Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 $ $
Sub-Sections A& D
23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
Sub-Sections A& E
24. Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 $ $
Sub-Sections A& E
25. One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 $ $
Table 728-1
26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class AA
27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class A
28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, Table 725-1, Class B
29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
725, 725-1, Class C
30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class S
31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 $ $
10086, Class B
32. Portiand Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
1006, Class P
33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
10086, Class S
34. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 $ $
10086, Class B
35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 $ $
38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 $ $
39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
40. Cold Mix, 1/2" Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specs
41. Cold Mix, 3/4” Cold Patch per City of TON 100 $ $
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications
42, Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 $ $
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications
43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8” per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1
44. Asphalt Concrete 1/2" per M.A.G. TON 100 $ $
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AREA

NO BID FROM THE
PHOENIX AREA //
THE CEMEX
TUCSON AREA IS
BIDDING THIS.

Sheet Florence, AZ 85132

Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

45, Asphalt Concrete 3/4” per M.A.G. TON 100 $
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

46. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2

47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 $ |
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2

48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 $
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2

49. Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 $

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711

** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.
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Provide PLANT address for this area:
AGGREGATES = MARICOPA PLANT # 8984 @ MARICOPA RD & GILA RIVER BOTTOM, MARICOPA, AZ

REDI MIX = MARICOPA PLANT # 1960 @ MARICOPA RD & GILA RIVER BOTTOM, MARICOPA, AZ
ASPHALT = GOMEZ ASPHALT BATCH PLANT # 1396 @ 5150 27™ AVE, PHOENIX, AZ
Delivery Area Item Material Unit Estimated Unit Price Unit Price
J Quantity Plant Jobsite
Maricopa 1. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 14.00
M.A.G. 702, Table 702-1
N. Hidden Valley 2. Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 N/A N/A
P.A.G. 303-2
3 Crushed Aggregate Base Material TON 100 $7.50 14.00
A.D.O.T. 302-2, Table 303-1
4. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material P.A.G. 304
5. Cement Treated Aggregate Base TON 100 N/A N/A
Material A.D.O.T. 304
6. Portland Cement Treated Aggregate TON 100 N/A N/A
Base Material M.A.G. 705
7. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table 702- TON 100 $7.50 $14.00
: 1, Type A ’
8. Select Material M.A.G. 702, Table TON 100 $7.50 $14.00
702-1, Type B
9. 2” Minus Screen Fill Material TON 100 $7.50 $14.00
10. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, LVT Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-1
1. Cover Materials M.A.G. 716, HVT TON 100 N/A N/A
Table 716-2
12. Cover Materials P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
Sub-Section C 3/8" Chips
13. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, HVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-2*
14. Cover Chips M.A.G. 716, LVT. Table TON 100 N/A N/A
716-1*
15. Cover Materials A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 100 N/A N/A
Sub-Section C 3/8” Chips
16. 3/8” Slurry Seal Materials, Cold Mix TON 100 N/A N/A
Overlay, M.A.G. 715, Table 715, Type Il
17. Aggregate Slurry Seal Coat P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
404-2.02, Sub-Section D and
404-2.03 through 404-2.05
18. Sand M.A.G. 701.3 TON 100 $14.50 $20.00
19. Blotter Material P.A.G. 404-2.02, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Section B
20. Blotter Material A.D.O.T. 404-2.02, TON 250 $14.50 $20.00
Sub-Section B
21. Dumped Riprap P.A.G., 913-2.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & D
22. Dumped Riprap A.D.O.T. 913-.01, TON 250 N/A N/A
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Finance Department
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P.O. Box 1348

Florence, AZ 85132

Sub-Sections A & D

23. Gabion Riprap P.A.G. 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A& E

24. Gabion Riprap A.D.O.T 913-2.01, TON 50 N/A N/A
Sub-Sections A & E

25. One Sack ABC Slurry M.A.G. 728, YD3 50 N/A $70.00
Table 728-1

26. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
725, Table 725-1, Class AA

27. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $90.00
725, Table 725-1, Class A

28. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $86.00
725, Table 725-1, Class B

29. Portland Cement Concrete M.A.G. YD3 100 N/A $84.00
725, 725-1, Class C

30. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1006, Class S

31. Portland Cement Concrete P.A.G. YD3 100 N/A N/A
1006, Class B

32. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
1006, Class P

33. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $100.00
1006, Class S
NOTE: THIS IS AN ADOT CLASS S
3000

34. Portland Cement Concrete A.D.O.T. YD3 100 N/A $83.00
1006, Class B

35. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A N/A

36. Shotcrete P.A.G. 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A N/A

37. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section A TON 100 N/A $120.00
NOTE: THIS IS A 4000 PSI
SHOTCRETE )

38. Shotcrete A.D.O.T 912, Sub-Section B TON 100 N/A $110.00
NOTE: THIS IS A 3000 PSI
SHOTCRETE

39. Cold Mix, 3/8” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

40. Cold Mix, 1/2” Cold Patch, City of TON 100 $110.00 $122.50
Phoenix Group 3 Specs

41. Cold Mix, 3/4”" Cold Patch per City of TON 100 N/A N/A
Phoenix Group 3 Specifications

42. Cold Patch Mix also known as UPM 557 TON 100 N/A N/A
per City of Phoenix Group 3
Specifications

43. Asphalt Concrete 3/8" per M.A.G. TON 100 $75.00 $87.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

44, Asphalt Concrete 1/2” per M.A.G. TON 100 $65.00 $77.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

45. Asphalt Concrete 3/4” per M.A.G. TON 100 $64.00 $76.50
Specifications Section 710, Table 710-1

46. Asphalt Concrete No. 1 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
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47. Asphalt Concrete No. 2 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
48. Asphalt Concrete No. 3 per P.A.G. TON 100 N/A N/A
Specifications Section 406, Table 406-2
49, Non-Specific Select Fill Material** TON 100 N/A N/A

* Indicates Pre-coated chips as per Specification 716.3 and refer to Asphalt Specification Section 711
** Material must be Approved by Pinal County Engineer or his/her designee prior to use.

CEmEX KAy DR/6S

Firm/Individual #

E-7/Y

ﬁd S¥nature and Date

END OF PRICING SHEET
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